
 
 

 
 

Summary of the Decisions Taken at the Meeting 
of Planning Committee held on 13 July 2023 

 
 

Agenda 
Item No. 

Agenda Item  Decision  

8 Land Used For Motorcross, 
Stratford Road, A422, Wroxton, 
OX15 6HX 
 
 

Refused, against officer 
recommendation. Reasons to be set 
out in the minutes. 

9 Land South of Green Lane, 
Chesterton 
 
 

Refused, in line with the officer 
recommendation. Reasons to be set 
out in the minutes. 

10 Land East of Ploughley Road, 
Ambrosden 
 
 

Refused, in line with officer 
recommendation. Reasons to be set 
out in the minutes. 

11 Land West Of Church Ley Field 
Adjacent To Blackthorn Road, 
Ambrosden 
 
 

Refused, against officer 
recommendation. Reasons to be set 
out in the minutes. 

12 Land To The North Of Wimborn 
Close And Mackley Close, 
Deddington 
 
 

Refused, against officer 
recommendation. Reasons to be set 
out in the minutes. 

13 OS Parcel 6982 South Of School 
Farm And East Of Railway Line, 
Station Road, Cropredy 
 
 

Application withdrawn by the 
applicant. 

14 Caravan Park, Station Approach, 
Banbury, OX16 5AB 
 
 

Approved in line with the officer 
recommendation, subject to 
conditions and S106 legal agreement, 
details to be set out in the minutes. 

15  Borough House, Marlborough 
Road, Banbury 
 
 

Refused, in line with the officer 
recommendation. Reasons to be set 
out in the minutes. 



 
 
Agenda 
Item No. 

Agenda Item  Decision  

16 Borough House, Marlborough 
Road, Banbury 
 
 

Refused, in line with the officer 
recommendation. Reasons to be set 
out in the minutes. 

17 Appeals Progress Report 
 
Report of Assistant Director Planning 
and Development 
 
Purpose of report 
 
To keep Members informed about 
planning appeal progress including 
decisions received and the scheduling 
of public inquiries and hearings for 
new and current appeals.  
 
Recommendations 
 
The meeting is recommended: 
 

1.1 To note the position on 
planning appeals contained 
within the report. 

Resolved 
 

(1) That the position statement be 
accepted. 

 


